Registered No. WB/SC-247 No. WB(Part-IV)/2017/SAR-5

Kolkata

Extraordinary
Published by Authority

MAGIHIA 24] MONDAY, FEBRUARY 13,2017 [SAKA 1938

PART IV—Bills introduced in the West Bengal Legislative Assembly; Reports of Select Committees
presented or to be presented to that Assembly; and Bills published before introduction in that

Assembly.
GOVERNMENT OF WEST BENGAL Rules of Procedure and Conduct of Business in the
LAW DEPARTMENT West Bengal Legislative Assembly, the publication of the
Legislative following Bill, together with the Statement of Objects and
NOTIFICATION Reasons which accompanies it, in the Kolkata Gazette,

No. 144-1.—13th February, 2017.—The Governor the Bill and the Statement of Objects and Reasons are

having been pleased to order, under rule 66 of the

Bill No. 5 of 2017

THE WEST BENGAL FINANCE BILL, 2017.
A
BILL

to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899, in its application to West Bengal, the
West Bengal Taxation Tribunal Act, 1987, the West Bengal Sales Tax (Settlement of
Dispute) Act, 1999, the West Bengal Tax on Entry of Goods into Local Areas Act, 2012,
and the West Bengal Value Added Tax A et, 2003, and to provide for validation in respect
of levy, assessment and collection of tax etc. under the West Bengal Tax on Entry of
Goods into Local Areas Act, 2072,

accordingly hereby published for general information:—

WHEREAS it IS expedient to amend the [5di inits application to 20l 1899.
West Bengal. the West Bengal Taxation Trlff,ﬁfaﬂ i{jt].] ]F‘?f;;f‘tl]ag 23&;1&11;}1 Sales Tax [y i
(Settlement of Dispute) Act. 1999, the West Bengal Tax on Entry of Goods into Local s Ben. Act IV
Areas Act, 2012, the West Bengal Value Added Tax Act, 2003, to provide for validation  of 1999.
in respect of levy, assessment and collection of tax etc. under the West Bengal Tax on }‘f;‘f’)‘ceﬁ“'o?;ém_

Entry of Goods into Local Areas Act, 2012, and for the purposes and in the manner  West Ben. Act |
hereinafter appearing; of 2012.
It is hereby enacted in the Sixty-eighth Year of the Republic of India, by the
Legislature of West Bengal, as follows:—
Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the West Bengal Finance Act, 2017.

com . . . » .
IRRe (2) Save as otherwise provided, this section and section 6 shall come into force at
once, section 5 shall be deemed to have come into force retrospectively from the 1st day



THE KOLKATA GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY, FEBRUARY 13, 2017

[PART IV

Application and
amendment of Act
2 of 1899

The West Bengal Finance Bill, 2017.

(Clause 2.)

of April, 2012, and the remaining provisions of this Act shall come into force on such
date, or shall be deemed to have come into force on such date, as the State Government

may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint, and different dates may be appointed
for different provisions of this Act.

2. (1) IntheIndian Stamp Act, 1899, in its application to West Bengal (hereinafter

referred to as the principal Act) shall, in its application to West Bengal, be amended for
the purpose and in the manner hereinafter provided.

(2) In Schedule IA to the principal Act,—

()

(®)

inarticle 5, in item (d), after the entries in the column under heading “Proper
stamp-duty”, the following proviso shall be inserted:—

“Provided that in case of agreement relating to sale or assignment or
lease-cum-sale for flats or apartments or units which are under construction
or to be constructed, the stamp-duty shall be charged at the rate of two
per centum of the market value of the property subject to fulfillment of
conditions as mentioned in article 23.

Explanation.—For the flats or apartments or units whose plan has been
sanctioned within the period from the 1st day of January, 2015 to the date of
effect of this section, the above provisions shall, mutatis mutandis, apply at
the time of registration of such agreement, subject to the conditions that the
final conveyance shall be completed within the 31st day of J anuary, 2019.”;

in article 23, after the entries in the column under heading

: ; “Proper
stamp-duty”, the following provisos shall be inserted:—

‘Provided that in any case when an agreement relating to sale is executed
and registered with the ad valorem stamp-duty required under the proviso
to article 5(d) and in furtherance of such agreement—

(a) if the final conveyance is made within four years from the date of
agreement or within two years from the date of completion/occupancy
certificate issued by appropriate authority or from the date of
procurement of electric connection, whichever is earlier, in favour
of the original purchaser or in favour of the member(s) of his/her
family, the market value of the property as assessed at the time of
registration of such agreement shall be treated as the market value
of the property for the purpose of determination of chargeability
at the time of registration of the final conveyance and the stamp-
duty to be paid on such conveyance shall be the difference between
the duty payable and the duty already paid under the proviso to article
5(d) at the time of registration of the agreement or rupees ten.
whichever is greater:

(b) if the final conveyance is made. beyond the time limit as specified in
clause (), in favour of the original purchaser or in favour of the
member(s) of his/her family, the market value of the property shall
be reassessed at the time of registration of such conveyance and the
stamp-duty to be paid on such conveyance shall be the difference
between the duty payable and the duty already paid under the proviso

to article 5(d) at the time of registration of the agreement or rupeces
ten, whichever is greater:

Provided further that the above provisions shall not be applicable, if
ﬁrfal‘ conveyance is made in favour of any person or persons other than the
original purchaser or the member(s) of his/her family.

Explanation.—TFor the purpose of this article, the expression “member
of a family” shall have the same meaning as defined in article 33

2 of 1899.




PArT 1V]

THE KOLKATA GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY, FEBRUARY 13, 2017

(©)

(d)

The West Bengal Finance Bill, 2017.

(Clause 2.)

in article 43,—

(i) initem (a), in the column under heading “Description of Instruments”,
for the words “of any goods including currency”, the words “of any
goods or commodities, excluding currency and interest rate relating
to forward contract,” shall be substituted; -

(if) initem (aa), in the column under heading “Description of Instruments”,
for the words “of any goods including currency”, the words “of any
goods or commodities, excluding currency and interest rate relating
to forward contract,” shall be substituted;

(iii) initem (ab), in the column under heading “Description of Instruments”,
for the words “of any goods including currency”, the words “of any
goods or commodities, excluding currency and interest rate relating
to forward contract,” shall be substituted;

(iv) initem (ac), in the column under heading “Description of Instruments”,
for the words “of any goods including currency”, the words “of any
goods or commodities, excluding currency and interest rate relating
to forward contract,” shall be substituted;

(v) after item (ac), in the columns under heading “Description of

Instruments” and “Proper stamp-duty” the following entries shall be
inserted:—

“(ad) of currency and interest rate relating to  One paise for
forward contract, including futures every Rs. 5,000 or
and premium on options contract and  part thereof’”;
also including all exercise and
assigned contracts, traded through an
association or otherwise;

(vi) initem (b), in sub-item (iv), in the columns under heading “Description
of Instruments”, for the words “if relating to forward contracts”, the
words “if relating to forward contracts, including futures and premium

on options contract and also including all exercise and assigned
contracts,” shall be substituted;

(vii) after item (b), in the columns under heading “Description of
Instruments” and “Proper stamp-duty”, the following entries relating
thereto shall be inserted:—

“(bb) of debt security including bond; Fifty paise for
every Rs. 1,00,000
or part thereof:™:

in the columns under headings “Description of Instruments™ and “Proper
stamp-duty™, the following entrics relating thereto shall be inserted:—

“43A. N(_)TE OR RECORD OF TRANSACTION
[Electronics or otherwise] cffected by a broker oragent
on sclf-account (proprictary trade) through a stock
exchange or the association o OtiICl'WiSE;

(a) if re]ating o purchase or sale of any goods or  Fifty paise for
commodities, excluding currency and interest  every Rs. 5.000

rate relating to forward contract, exceeding in or part thereof:
value twenty rupees;

(aa) if relating to purchase or sale of any goods or  Five paise for
commodities, excluding currency and interest every Rs. 5,000
rate relating to forward contract, exceeding in  or part thereof;
value twenty rupees but not delivered;



THE KOLKATA GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY, FEBRUARY 13, 2017

[ParT 1V

(ab)

(ac)

(ad)

(b)

[

The West Bengal Finance Bill, 2017.

(Clause 2.)

if relating to purchase or sale of any goods or
commodities, excluding currency and interest
rate relating to forward contract, exceeding in
value twenty rupees relating to future and
options trading;

if relating to purchase or sale of any goods or
commodities, excluding currency and interest
rate relating to forward contract, exceeding in
value twenty rupees relating to forward contract
of commodities, including futures and premium
on options contract and also including all
exercise and assigned contracts;

if relating to purchase or sale of currency and
interest rate relating to forward contract,
including futures and premium on options
contract and also including all exercise and
assigned contracts;

if relating to purchase or sale of any stock or
marketable security exceeding in value twenty
rupees but not being a debt security or
Government security;

(i) in case of delivery

(ii) in case of non-delivery

(iii) if relating to future and options trading

(iv) ifrelating to forward contracts, including
futures and premium on options contract
and also including all exercise and
assigned contracts;

(bb) of debt security including bond

(c) of a Government security

Five paise for
every Rs. 5,000
or part thereof;

Five paise for
every Rs. 5,000
or part thereof;

One paise for
every Rs. 5,000
or part thereof;

Fifty paise for
every Rs. 5,000
or part thereof;

Five paise for
every Rs. 5,000
or part thereof;

Five paise for
every Rs. 5,000
or part thereof

Five paise for
every Rs. 5,000
or part thereof;

Fifty paise for
every Rs. 1.00.000
or part thereof;

Subject to
maximum  of
rupees  fifty,

fifty paise for
every Rs. 10,000
or part thereof of
the value of the
security.”;

(e) in article 63, after the entries in the column under hu::ading “Proper
stamp-duty”, the following provisos are to be added:—

‘Provided that in any case when an agreement relating to
assignment or lease-cum-sale is executed and registered with the




Part 1V]

THE KOLKATA GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY, FEBRUARY 13, 2017

Amendment of
West Ben. Act
VIII of 1987.

Amendment ol
West Ben. Act
IV of 1999.

Amendment of
West Ben, Act |
of 2012,

The West Bengal Finance Bill, 2017.

(Clauses 3-5.)

ad valorem stamp-duty required under the proviso to article 5(d)
and in furtherance of such agreement—

(a) if the final assignment or lease-cum-sale is made, within four
years from the date of agreement or within two years from the
date of completion or occupancy certificate issued by
appropriate authority or from the date of procurement of electric
connection, whichever is earlier, in favour of the original
purchaser or in favour of the member(s) of his or her family,
the market value of the property as assessed at the time of
registration of such agreement shall be treated as the market
value of the property for the purpose of determination of
chargeability at the time of registration of the final assignment
or lease-cum-sale and the stamp-duty to be paid on such
assignment or lease-cum-sale, shall be the difference between
the duty payable and the duty already paid under the proviso to
article 5(d) at the time of registration of the agreement or
rupees ten, whichever is greater;

(b) if the final assignment or’ lease-cum-sale is made beyond the
time limit as specified in clause (a), in favour of the original
purchaser or in favour of the member(s) of his/her family, the
market value of the property shall be reassessed at the time of
registration of such assignment or lease-cum-sale and the stamp-
duty to be paid on such assignment or lease-cum-sale, shall be
the difference between the duty payable and the duty already
paid under the proviso to article 5(d) at the time of registration
of the agreement or rupees ten, whichever is greater:

Provided further that the above provisions shall not be applicable
if final assignment or lease-cum-sale is made in favour of any person
or persons other than those specified therein.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this article, the expression
“member of a family” shall have the same meaning as defined in
article 33.°.

3. Inthe West Bengal Taxation Tribunal Act, 1987, in the Schedule, after the last
entry relating to “The West Bengal Value Added Tax Act, 2003”, the following entries
shall be inserted under the columns with headings “Year”, “Number” and “Short title
of the specified State Act”, respectively:—

“20121 The West Bengal Tax on Entry of Goods into Local Areas Act, 2012,

4., Inthe West Bengal Sales Tax (Settlement of Dispute) Act. 1999. in section 8.

in su.l‘a—scctlon (1), for the words “seven working days™, the words “fifteen working
days” shall be substituted.

5. In the West Bengal Tax on Entry of Goods into Local Areas Act, 2012,—

(1) msection 4, in sub-section (5), for clause (b) and clause (c). the following

clause _shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from 1st day
of April, 2012:—

“(b) turnover of imports of a dealer whose such turnover does not exceed
rupees five lakh during a return period, subject to a maximum of
total deduction of rupees twenty lakh in a year;”;

(2) insection 18, in sub-section (1), in clause (c), for the words “maintenance
of linking”, the words “maintenance of infrastructure for linking” shall
be deemed to have been substituted from the 1st day of April. 2012.

West Ben. Act
VIIT of 1987.

West Ben. Act
IV of 1999.

West Ben. Act |
of 2012,




6 THE KOLKATA GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY, FEBRUARY 13, 2017 [ParT IV
The West Bengal Finance Bill, 2017.
(Clauses 6, 7.)
Validation in

respect of the
West Bengal Tax
on Entry of
Goods into Local
Areas Act, 2012,

Amendment of
West Ben. Act
XXXVII of 2003.

6. Notwithstanding anything contained in any judgment, decree or order of any

court or other authority, no levy, assessment including provisional assessment, deemed
assessment Or summary assessment, reassessment or collection of any tax, interest,
late fee or penalty made or purporting to have been made under the provisions of the
West Bengal Tax on Entry of Goods into Local Areas Act, 2012 (hereinafter referred to
as the said Act) before the date of coming into force of this provision, shall be deemed
to be invalid or ever to have been invalid on the ground only that such levy, assessment
including provisional assessment, deemed assessment or summary assessment,
reassessment or collection was not in accordance with law and such tax, interest, late
fee or penalty levied, assessed, reassessed or collected or imposed or purporting to
have been levied, assessed, reassessed or collected or imposed shall, for all purposes,
be deemed to be and always to have been validly levied, assessed, reassessed or collected
or imposed as if such levy, assessment including provisional assessment, deemed
assessment or summary assessment, reassessment or collection or action or thing, had
been made, taken or done under the said Act as amended by section 5 of the principal
Act, and accordingly—

(i) all acts, proceedings or things done or taken by the State Gfovernment' or
by any officer of the State Government or by any authority in connection
with the levy, assessment including provisional assessment, deemed
assessment or summary assessment, reassessment or collection of such
tax, interest, late fee or penalty shall, for all purposes, be deemed to be
and to have always been done or taken in accordance with law;

(ii) no suit or other proceedings shall be maintained or continued in any court
against the State Government or any person or other authority whatsoever
for the refund of any tax, interest, late fee or penalty so paid;

(iii) refund shall be made upon assessment to a dealer who has already paid
the tax but is covered by clause (b) of sub-section (5) of section 4 of the
said Act; and

(iv) no court shall enforce any decree or order directing the refund of any tax,
interest, late fee or penalty so paid:

Provided that nothing in this section shall be construed as preventing any person
from questioning, in accordance with the provisions of the said Act and rules made
thereunder, the assessment of any tax for any period, or from claiming refund of any

ta"{(’i i:tercst or late fee paid by him in excess of the amount payable by him under the
said Act.

7. In the West Bengal Value Added Tax Act, 2003, —
(1) insection 10, in sub-section (3), in clause (b), in the proviso, for the words
“ten lakh rupees™, the words “twenty lakh rupees” shall be substituted:
(2) in section 14—
(a) in sub-section (4), for the words “ten lakh rupees”. occurring in two
places, the words “twenty lakh rupees” shall be substituted:
(b) in sub-section (5). for the words “ten lakh rupees™, the words “twenty
lakh rupees™ shall be substituted:
(c) insub-section (6), for the words “ten lakh rupees™. the words “twenty
lakh rupees™ shall be substituted:
(d) 1insub-section (7), for the words “ten lakh rupees”, the words “twenty
lakh rupees”™ shall be substituted:
(e) insub-section (8), for the words “ten lakh rupees”, the words “twenty
lakh rupees” shall be substituted;
(3) in section 16, in sub-section (3),—
(a) for the words “at such compounded rate notexceeding one
per centum”, the words “at such compounded rate or rates not
exceeding three per centum” shall be substituted;

West Ben. Act |
of 2012.

t Ben. Act
YV of 2003.



ParT 1V] THE KOLKATA GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY, FEBRUARY 13, 2017

The West Bengal Finance Bill, 2017.

(Clause 7.)

(b) for the words, figure and brackets “in lieu of tax payable under sub-

section (2), on all his sales”, the words, figure and brackets “in lieu
of tax payable under sub-section (2), on all his sales, and for such
purpose different rates may be prescribed for different class of
dealers” shall be substituted;

(¢) in the proviso, clause (b) shall be omitted;
(4) in section 30E,—
(a) sub-section (1A) shall be omitted;
(b) sub-section (1B) shall be omitted;
(c) insub-section (1C), for the words, figures, letters and brackets “Every

registered dealer, other than those mentioned in sub-section (1A) or
sub-section (1B), who are required”, the words “Every registered
dealer who is required” shall be substituted;

(d) in sub-section (2), for the words, figures, letters and brackets “sub-

section (1), sub-section (1A), sub-section (1B)”, the words, figure
and brackets “sub-section (1) shall be substituted;

(5) in section 77, in sub-section (1), in the TABLE,—
(a) in the entry in column (2) against serial number 1 in column (1), for

(b)

the words “does not exceed four per centum”, the words “does not
exceed five per centum” shall be substituted:

in the entry in column (2) against serial number 2 in column (1), for
the words “exceeds four per centum but does not exceed fifteen
per centum”, the words “exceeds five per centum but does not exceed
fifteen per centum” shall be substituted;

(6) in Schedule A,—

()

(b)

(c)

(d)

(e)

(f

after serial number 4A in column (1) and the corresponding
entry in column (2), the following serial numbers in column (1) and
entries relating thereto in column (2) shall be inserted:—

“4B. Biodiesel, excluding ethanol.

4C. Biomass briquettes.”;

after serial number 20E in column (1) and the corresponding entry

in column (2), the following serial number in column (1) and entries
relating thereto in column (2) shall be inserted:—

“20F. Hair bands and hair clips.”;

after serial number 22BA in column (1) and the corresponding entry
i column (2), the following serial number in column (1) and entry
relating thereto in column (2) shall be inserted:—

22BB, Kerosene stove.™:

?lﬂe" serial number 23AA in column (1) and the corresponding entry
n cqlumn (2). the following serial number in column (1) and entry
relating thereto in column (2) shall be inserted:—

“23AB. Leaf plates and cups.™;

in the entry in column (2) against serial number 35D in column (1),
for the words “solar lights,” the words “solar lights, solar water
heaters,” shall be substituted;

in the entry in column (2) against serial number 40 in column (l),,
for the words “Tile frame™, the words “Teracotta tiles, tile frame”
shall be substituted;



THE KOLKATA GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY, FEBRUARY 13, 2017

[ParT IV

The West Bengal Finance Bill, 201 7.

(Clause 7.)

(7) in Schedule C,—
(a) in Part I,—
(i) serial number 13A in column (1) and the corresponding entries
in column (2) shall be omitted;
(ii) serial number 34A in column (1) and the corresponding
entries in column (2) shall be omitted;
(iii) serial number 43BB in column (1) and the corresponding
entries in column (2) shall be omitted;
(iv) serial number 44 in column (1) and the corresponding entries
in column (2) shall be omitted;
(v) inthe entry in column (2) against serial number 54B in column

(1), after item number (xxvii) and the entry thereto, the
following item number and entry thereto shall be inserted:—

“(xxviii) Machinery for generation of electricity from waste;".

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS.

_ The Bill, namely, the West Bengal Finance Bill, 2017, seeks to amend the following
principal Acts:—

(i) the Indian Stamp Act, 1899, in its application to West Bengal, is sought to be
amended—

(a) to give relief by reducing the stamp-duty from 5-7% to 2% of the market
value of the property for registration of Agreement relating to Sale
provided that final deed is registered within 4 years;

(b) to reduce the rate of stamp-duty in respect of trading on proprietary
account by trading member for itself or himself by creating an Article
43A (Note or Record of Transaction); and

(c) to reduce stamp duty on trading items like currency and interest rate
from 0.002% to 0.0002%, and also to introduce nominal rate of stamp-
duty at the rate 0.0005% on debt security including bond which are
presently transacted in the stock exchanges;

(i) the West Bengal Taxation Tribunal Act, 1987, is sought to be amended to
specify The West Bengal Tax on Entry of Goods into Local Areas Act, 2012
within the jurisdiction of the West Bengal Taxation Tribunal;

(iii) the West Bengal Sales Tax (Settlement of Dispute) Act, 1999, is sought to be
amended to provide for issue of provisional certificate of settlement withip

15 working days:

(iv) the West Bengal Tax on Entry of Goods into Local Areas Act. 2012, is sought ‘

to be amended—

(a) by section 5 of this Bill with re_tros‘pecti_ve effect from the Ist day of
April. 2012, in light of t.he _gu:delmes In the judgement dated 11th
November. 2016 of Constitution Bench of the Honble Supreme Court,
10 remove the infirmities in Il'lt? said Act with regard to article 304(a) of
the Constitution as mentioned in the judgement dated 24th March, 2013
of the Hon’ble Single Judge of Calcutta High Court; and

(b) to provide relief by way of exemption from payment of entry tax to
dealers having turnover of imports upto rupees five lakh during a return
period, subject to a maximum of total deduction of rupees twenty lakh
N a year; and

() by section 6 of this Bill to provide for validation in respect of the
same;



Part 1V] THE KOLKATA GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY, FEBRUARY 13, 2017

The West Bengal Finance Bill, 2017.

(v) the West Bengal Value Added Tax Act, 2003 is sought to be amended—

(a) to give relief from payment of tax to dealers having turnover more than
Rs. 10 lakh and upto Rs. 20 lakh by increasing the threshold of turnover
for VAT liability from present Rs. 10 lakh to Rs. 20 lakh;

(b) to extend the benefit of composition scheme currently being enjoyed
by traders having turnover upto Rs. 50 lakh to small manufacturing

dealers and give them an option to pay tax at a small percentage of the
turnover;

(c) to give relief to the taxpayer by removing the mandatory provision of
submission of VAT audit report of the chartered accountants or cost
accountants for all class of dealers irrespective of the turnover;

(d) to give reliefto the dealers by reducing the amount of penalty for seizure
of goods from 25% to 15% in case of goods taxable at the lower VAT
rate of 5%,

(e) to completely exempt from payment of tax on biodiesel excluding
ethanol, biomass briquettes, hair bands and hair clips, solar water heaters,
kerosene stove, leaf plates and cups, and terracotta tiles;

(® to lower the rate of tax from 14.5% to 5% on sales of machinery for

generation of electricity from waste.
2.

Th B S
he Bill hag been framed with the above objectives in VIEW.
3,

There ; . .
€I 1s no financial implication involved in the Bill.

KULKA
The 131;2’ Feby- DR. AMIT MITRA,
ruary, 2017, Member-in-Charge.

By order of the Governor,

MADHUMATI MITRA,
Secy. to the Govi. of West Bengal,
Law Department.

Published by Law Department, Government of West Bengal and i
Printed at Saraswaty Press Ltd. (Government of West Bengal Enterprise), Kolkata 700 056.



